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DATE: September 21, 2020

TO: Honorable Charter Township of Waterford Board of Trustees
FROM.: Russell D. Williams, DPW Director

RE: Campus Waste & Recycling Removal Contract

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
Russell Williams

Director

Joseph Ashley

Water & Sewer Superintendent

Justin Westlake

Facilities & Operations Superintendent
Derek Diederich

Administrative Superintendent

Frank Fisher

Engineering Superintendent

Please review the attached memo from Mr. Justin Westlake, DPW Facilities & Operations

Superintendent in reference to campus waste and recycling disposal.

Per the Waterford Township Procurement Policy, sealed bids where accepted and opened on
September 1, 2020 in the townhall auditorium in the presence of Mr. Gary Wall, Waterford Township
Supervisor, Ms. Kimberly Markee, Waterford Township Clerk, Ms. Dawn Cito, Waterford Township
Purchasing Account Coordinator and Mr. Justin Westlake, Waterford Township DPW Facilities and

Operations Superintendent.

Requested Board Action

Award contract DPW-20-01 to Advanced Disposal, a three-year campus wide
waste and recycling disposal contract for $55,967.59.

cc. Mr. Gary Wall, Waterford Township Supervisor
Ms. Kimberly Markee, Waterford Township Clerk
Mr. Justin Westlake, Waterford Township DPW Facilities and Operations Superintendent

With us there are no boundaties



DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

BOARD OF TRUSTEES & Russell D, Williams
Gary Wall, Supervisor ;"'w Director
Kim Markee, Clerk Joseph P, Ashley

Margaret Birch, Treasurer TOWNSHIP Water and Sewer Superintendent

Anthony M. Bartolotta, Trustee Justin Westlake
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Karen Joliat, Trustee Waterford, Michigan 48329-3773 PTY. - AU
Steve Thomas, Trustee Telephone: (248) 674-2278 Fax: (248) 674-8658 Frank Fisher
www.waterfordmi.gov Engineering Superintendent

To: Russell Williams; DPW Director
From: Justin Westlake; Waterford Facilities & Operations Superintendent ﬁ'
Date:  September 8™, 2020

Subject: Bid Tabulation for DPW-20-01 — Trash & Recycling Removal —
2021-2022-2023

There were two sealed bids opened on September 1%, at 2:00pm for this three-year
contract. The bids were opened and read aloud on September 1%, All bids were
accompanied by bid bonds. Below is a summary of the bids.

Waste Removal Total Base Bid Total Base Bid Total Base Bid
Contractor 2021 2022 2023 3 Year Total
Green For Life $22,541.00 $23,403.00 $24,469.00 $70,413.00
Advanced Disposal $17,774.00 $18,631.20 $19,562.39 $55,967.59

Advanced Disposal submitted the lowest cumulative bid over the three year term, and is in
compliance with the bid specifications for the contract years 2021, 2022, and 2023.
Additionally, Advanced Disposal has handled this contract in recent years for Waterford
and has done an excellent job.

Recommendation:

It is my recommendation to award the contract (DPW-20-01) to Advanced Disposal for
contract years 2021, 2022, and 2023.

Cc: File
Ce: Gary Wall

With us there are no boundaries



Calendar Year 2021 (WITHOUT Receyeling Calculated):

Dollars and cents,
(In Writing) (In Writing)

&\Q O+, 0O Dollars and . < Q cents.
(In Figures) (In Figures)

Calendar Year 2022 (WITHOUT Recycling Calculated):

Dollars and cents,
(In Writing) (In Writing)

£2.04y OV, 20 Dollars and e 22 cents,
(In Figures) (In Figures)

Calendar Year 2023 (WITHOUT Recycling Calculated):

&2 YOt Lw A Dollars and  * o™ cents.
(In Writing) (In Writing)

The BASE BID will be filled out completely as required. The Base Bid will reflect the cost to complete the entire
project as specified in these documents,

Prices shall be shown in both words and figures, In case of discrepancy, the amount shown in words shall govern.

The successful Contractor shall be required to begin work within the time specified herein. The Contractor
understands that the Owner reserves the right to reject any or all bids and to waive any informalities in the bidding,
The Contractor agrees that their bid shall be good and may not be withdrawn for a period of ninety (90) calendar
days after the scheduled closing time for receiving bids,

Upon receipt of written notice of acceptance of this bid, Contractor will execute the formal Contract within the time
specified herein and deliver the surety bond or bonds required.

Signed at 4941 White Lake Road; Clarkston Michigan, 48346 o, miQ %ﬂ-éay of < }9_1037‘ p 20.;9(_:)
ompany Address
By: Mark Nighbor Vice President
. “Name Title

Office Telephone Number: (248) 625-5470

Federal License No, 76-0839612 SEAL: If by Corporation
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BASE BID — Calendar Year 2021

Residential Recyeling Program Monthly Annual
Equipment NO BID NO BID
Manpower/Labor NO BID NO BID
RESIDENTIAL SUBTOTAL NO BID NO BID

All Locations to be Serviced Once per week

Location Type of Container Size

FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SITES

51¢ District Court Dumpster Trash 4 yard
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart (optional)  9Ggal

5100 Civic Center Drive Dumpster Recycle 2 yard

Facilities & Operations ~ Dumpster Trash 6 Yard

5170 Civic Center Drive

FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SUBTOTAL

TOWNSHIP LIBRARY SITES

Township Library Dumpster Trash 6 yard

5168 Civic Center Drive  Dumpster Recycle 2 yard
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal

TOWNSHIP LIBRARY TOTAL

POLICE DEPARTMENT SITES

Police Department & Dumpster Trash 8 yard

Town Hall Dumpster Recycle 8 yard

5150 Civic Center Drive (Gated) Recycle Cart 64 gal
(optional)
Recycle Cart 96 gal
(optional)
POLICE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL
FIRE DEPARTMENT SITES
Fire Station #1 Dumpster Trash 6 yard
2495 Crescent Lake Rd  Dumpster Recycle 2 yard
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal
Fire Station #2 Dumpster Trash 4 yard
4596 W Walton Blvd Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal

25

Service

Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/ 12mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Monthly Annual
$40.00 $480.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$45.00 $540.00
$59.00 $708.00
$144.00 $1,728.00

Monthly Annual
$59.00 $708.00
$4500 _  $540.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$104.00 $1,248.00

Monthly Annual
$81.00 $972.00
$6500 $780.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$146.00 $1,752.00

Monthly Annual
$59.00 $708.00
$45.00 $540.00
NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
$40.00 $480.00
NO BID NOBID
NO BID NO BID




Fire Station #3

3435 Elizabeth Lake Rd

Fire Station #4

6615 Williams Lake Rd

Fire Station #5

25 N Hospital Road

Dumpster Trash 6 yard  Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optionaly 64 gal EOW/12 mo
Recycle Cart(optional) 96 gal EOW/12 mo

Duipster Trash 2yard  Wkiy/12 mo
Recyele Cait (optional) 64 gal EOW/12mo
Recyele Cart (optional) 96 gal EOW/{2mo

Dumupster Trash 2yard  WEkiy/12 mo
Recycle Caxt (optional) 64 gal EOW/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal EOW/12 mo

FIRE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Parks Maintenance Garage Dumpster Trash 6 yard Wkiy/12 mo

4458 Hatchery Road

Nature Center
2125 Denby

Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal Wkiy/12 mo
Recyele Cart {optional) 90 gal  Wkiy/12 mo

Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkiy/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional} 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkiy/12 mo

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

Bid Specifications

All Locations to be Serviced T'wice per week, except for Recycling

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS SITES

DPW Bldg,

5240 Civic Center Dy

(Gated)

DPW SUBTOTAL

Dumpster Trash g yard 2x-Wkiy/12mo
Dumpster Recycle dyard  2x-Wkly/12mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/i2 mo

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Recreation Center
5640 Williams Lake Rd

Hess-Hathaway Park
825 S Williams Lake Rd

Dumpster Trash yard 2x-Wkly/12mo
Dumpster Recycle(optional)d yard 2x-Wkly/{2mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo

Brampster Trash Syard  2x-Wkiy/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 pal  Wkiy/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 pal  Wkiy/12 mo

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL
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$59.00 $708.00
NO BID NC BID
NO BID NC BID
$35.00 $420.00
NOBID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$35.00 $420.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$273.00 $3,276..00
Monthly Annual
5$59.00 $708.00
NG BID NQ BID
NO BID NOBID
$40.00 $480.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO 8ID
$09.00 $1,188.00
Monthly Annual
$162.00 $1,944.00
$110.00 $1,320.00
NO BID NC BID
NO BID NO BID
$272.00 $3,264.00
Monthly Annual
$162.00 $1.944.00
$110.00 $1,320.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BiD
$162.00 $1,944.00
NC BID NO BID
NO 81D NO BID
$434..00 $5,208.00




The following dwmpsters are located in Township Parks and serviced seven months per vear (Apyil 1 —
Qctoher 31)

We prefer the following to be picked on Fridays or Mendays

Location Type of Container Size  Seivice Monthly Aunual

Sheli Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/fno $40.00 $280.00
4373 Dixie Hwy.

Optimisi Park ~ Dumopster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/Tmo $40.00 $280.00
Entrance where dumpster
is located: 214 Briscoe

Herrington Pack Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/Tmo $40.00 $280.00
1216 Lochaven Road

Rotary Park Dumpster Trash 4yard  Wkly/7mo $40.00 $280.00
5485 Tubbs Road

Lions Park Dumpster Trash 4yard  Wkiy/7mo $40.00 $280.00
4250 Fenmore

PARKS TOTAL (SEVEN MONTH ONLY) $200.00  $1,400.00

Grand Total All Sites Annually

$19,064.00
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Charter Township of Waterford
Trash & Recyclable Material Removal

Supplemental Bid Sheet

UNIT PRICING

In the event additional services are required, all prospeciive bidders shal!l be required to provide a unit cost schedule
for all material listed below.

2 yard dampster $35/molwaekly
4 yard dumpster $40/molwaekly
6 yard dumpster $59/mofwaekly
8 yard dumpster $81/mofweekly
20 yard open top $275 + delivery
30 yard open top $375 + delivery
64 galton recycle cart (OPTIONAL) NO BID

96 gallon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) NOBID

Residential Recycling Program — Specify ilems to be included

NO BID

Office Paper Recycling Pick up — Specify ilems and preparation of ifems (commingled, boxes crushed)

STANDARD MIXED USE PAPER AND CARDBOARD

Provide the names, address, contact person & telephone numbers of end users

MR. JUSTIN WESTLAKE

FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SUPERINTENDENT
WATERFORD TOWNSHIP DFW

5240 CIVIC CENTER DRIVE ’
WATERFORD, Mi 48329

(248) 618-7456
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BASE BID — Calendar Year 2022

Residential Recyeling Program

Equipment
Manpower/Labor

RESIDENTIAL SUBTOTAL

Monthly Annual
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

All Locations to be Serviced Onee per week

Location Type of Container

FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SITES

51% District Count Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)
5100 Civic Center Drive  Dumpster Recycle
Facilities & Operations
5170 Civic Center Drive

Dumpster Trash

FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SUBTOTAL

TOWNSHIP LIBRARY SITES

Township Library
5168 Civic Center Drive

Dumpster Trash
Dumpster Recycle
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

TOWNSHIP LIBRARY TOTAL

POLICE DEPARTMENT SITES

Police Department &

Town Hall

5150 Civic Center Drive (Gated) Recycle Cart
(optional)
Recycle Cart
(optional)
POLICE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL

FIRE DEPARTMENT SITES

Fire Station #1
2495 Crescent Lake Rd

Dumpster Trash
Dumpster Reeycle
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

Fire Station #2
4596 W Walton Blvd

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash
Dumpster Recycle 8 yard

Size

4 yard
64 gal
96gal

2 yard

6 Yard

6 yard
2 yard
64 gal
96 gal

8 yard

64 gal

96 gal

6 yard
2 yard
64 gal
96 gal

4 yard
64 gal
96 gal
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Service

Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/ 12mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Monthly Annual
$42.00 $504.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$47.25 $567.00
$61.95 $743.40
$151.20 $1814.40

Monthly Annual
$61.95 $743.40
$47.25 $567.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$109.20 $1,310.40

Monthly Annual
$85.05 $1,020.60
$68.25 $819.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$153.30 $1,839.60

Monthly Annual
$61.95 $743.40
$47.25 $567.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$42.00 $504.00
NO BID NO BID
NOBID NO BID




Fire Station #3

3435 Elizabeth Lake Rd

Fire Station {4

6615 Williams Lake Rd

Fire Station #5

25 N Hospital Road

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart(optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recyole Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

FIRE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Parks Maintenance Garage Dumpster Trash

4458 Hatchery Road

MNature Center
2125 Denby

Recyele Cart {optional)
Recyele Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycele Cart {optional)

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

6 yard
64 pal
96 gal

2 yard
64 gal
96 gal

2 yard
64 gal
96 gal

6 yard
64 gal
96 gal

4 yard
64 pal
96 gal

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkiy/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 no
Wkiy/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Bid Specifications

Al Locations to be Serviced Twice per week, except for Recycling

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORIKS SITES

DPW Bldg.

5240 Civic Center Dt

{Gated)

DPW SUBTOTAL

Dumpster Trash
Dinnpster Recycle

8 vard
4 yard

Recycle Cart {optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart {optional) 96 gal

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Recreation Center
5640 Williams Lake Rd

Hess-Hathaway Patk
825 8 Williams Lake Rd

Dumpster Trash

Dusnpster Recyele(optional)d yard

Recycle Cart (optional}
Regycele Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

8 yard

64 gal
96 gal

8 yard

64 gal
96 gal

30

2x-Wkly/12mo
2x-Wkly/12mo

Wkiy/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

2x-Wkiy/12mo
2x-Wkiy/[2mo

Wkiy/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

2x-Wkiy/12 mo

Whkiy/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

$61.95 $743.40
NO BID NOBID
NO BID NO BIP
$36.75 $441.00
NO BID NG BID
NO BID NOBID
$36.75 $441.00
NO BID NOBID
NO BID NOBID
$286.65 $3430.80
Monthly Annual
$61.95 $743.40
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$42.00 $504.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$103.95 $1.247.40
Monuthly Annual
$170.10 $2,041.20
$115.50 $1,386.00
NO BID NOBID
NO BID NO BID
$286.60 $3,427.20
Monthly Annual
$170.10 $2,041.20
$115.50 $1,386.00
NO BID NO BID
NOBID NO BID
$170.10 $2,041.20
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$456.70 $5,468.40




The follewing dumpsters ave located in Township Parks and sexviced seven months per vear (April 1 —

We prefer the following to e picked on Fridays or Mondays

Oclober 31)
Location Type of Container
Shell Park Dumpster Trash

4373 Dixie Hwy,

Optimist Park Dumpster Trash
Entrance where dumpster
is located: 214 Briscoe

Herrington Park Dumpster Trash
1216 Lochaven Road

Rotary Park Dumpster Trash
5485 Tubbs Road

Lions Park Dumpster Trash

4250 Fenmore Ave.

PARKS TOTAL (SEVEN MONTH ONLY)
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Size Service Monthly Annual
4yard  Wkly/7mo $42.00 $294.00
4 yard  Wkly/Tmo $42.00 $294.00
4 yard  Wkly/7mo $42.00 $294.00
4yard Wkly/7mo $42.00 $294.00
4yard  WKly/7Tmo $42.00 $294.00

$210.00 $1,470.00

Grand Total All Sites Annually

$20,017.20




Charter Towuship of Waterford
Trash & Reeyclable Material Remaoval

Supplemental Bid Sheet

UNIT PRICING

In the event additional services are required, all prospective bidders shall be required to provide a unit cost schedule
for all material listed below.

2 yard dumpster $36.75/molweekly
4 yard dumpster $42.00/mo/waekly
6 yard dumpster $61.95/mofweskly
8 vard dumpster $85.05/mofweskly
20 yard open top $295 + delivery
30 yard open top 5395 + delivery
64 gallon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) NO BID

96 gallon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) NQ BID

Residential Recycling Program — Specify items to be included

NO BID

Office Paper Recycling Pick up — Specify items and preparation of items (commingled, boxes crushed)

STANDARD MIXED USE PAPER AND CARDBOARD

Provide the names, address, contact person & telephone numbers of end users

MR, JUSTIN WESTLAKE

FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SUPERINTENDANT
WATERFORD TOWNSHIP DPW

5240 CIVIC CENTER DRIVE

WATERFORD, MI 48329

(248) 618-7456
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BASE BID — Calendar Year 2023

Residential Recycling Program Monthly Annual
Equipment NO BID NO BID
Manpower/Labor NO BID NO BID
RESIDENTIAL SUBTOTAL NOBID NOBID

All Locations to be Serviced Once per week

Location Type of Container Size  Service
FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SITES Monthly Amnual
51 District Courl Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/12 mo $44.10 $529.20
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo NO BID NO BID
Recycle Cart (optional)  96gal ~ Wkly/12 mo NO BID NO BID
5100 Civic Center Drive  Dumpster Recycle 2yard EOW/12 mo $49.61 $595.35
Facilities & Operations  Dumpster Trash 6 Yard Wkly/12 mo $65.05 $780.57
5170 Civic Center Drive
FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SUBTOTAL $158.76 $1,905.12
TOWNSHIP LIBRARY SITES Monthly Annual
Township Library Dumpster Trash 6 yard Wkly/12 mo $65.05 $780.57
5168 Civic Center Drive Dumpster Recycle 2yard EOW/12 mo $49.61 $595.35
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo NOBID NO BID
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo NO BID NO BID
TOWNSHIP LIBRARY TOTAL $114.66 $1,375.92
POLICE DEPARTMENT SITES Monthly Annual
Police Department & Dumpster Trash 8 yard Wkly/12 mo $89.30 $1,071.60
Town Hall Dumpster Recycle 8 yard EOW/12 mo $71.66 $859.92
5150 Civic Center Drive (Gated) Recycle Cart 64 gal Wkly/12 mo NO BID NO BID
(optional)
Recyele Cart 96 gal Wkly/12 mo NO BID NO BID
(optional)
POLICE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL $160.96 $1,931.52
FIRE DEPARTMENT SITES Monthly Annual
Fire Station 1 Dumpster Trash 6 yard Wkly/12 mo $65.04 $780.57
2495 Crescent Lake Rd Dumpster Recycle 2yad EOW/ [2mo $49.60 $595.22
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo NO BID NO BID
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo NO BID NO BID
Fire Station #2 Dumpster Trash 4 yard Wkly/12 mo $44.10 $529.20
4596 W Walton Blvd Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal EOW/12 mo NOBID NO BID
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal EOW/12 mo NO BID NO BID
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Fire Station #3

34335 Elizabeth Lake Rd

Fire Station Hd

6615 Williams Lake Rd

Fire Station #5
25 N Hospital Road

Dumpster Trash 6yard Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal EOW/12 mo
Recyele Cart{optional) 96 gal EOW/12mo

Dinapster Trash 2yard  Wkly/12 mo
Reeycle Cait {optional} 64 gal EQW/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal EOW/I2mo

Dumpster Trash 2yard  Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal EOW/12 mo
Reeycele Cart {optional}) 96 gal EOW/12 mo

FIRE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Parks Maintenance Garage Dumpster Trash Gyard Wkly/12 mo

4458 Hatchery Road

Mature Center
2125 Denby

Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo

Dumpster Trash 4 yard Wkiy/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 pal  Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal Wkly/I2 mo

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

Bid Specifications

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS SITES

DPW Bldg,

5240 Civic Center Dr

{Gated)

DPW SUBTOTAL

Dumpster Trash 8 yard 2x-Wkiy/12mo
Dumpster Recycle 4 yard  2x-Wkly/t2mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal  Wkiy/12 mo
Recycle Cart {optional) 96 gal  Wkiy/12 mo

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Recreation Center
5640 Willians Lake Rd

Hess-Hathaway Park
§25 S Williams Lake Rd

Pumpster Trash 8 yard  2x-Wkly/12mo
Dumpster Recycle(optional)d yard 2x-Wkly/12mo
Recycle Cart (optional}) 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo

Duwitipster Trash 8 yard  2x-Wkly/12 mo
Recycle Cavt (optional) 64 gal  Wkiy/12 mo
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

34

All Loeations to be Serviced Twice per weely, except for Recyeling

$65.04 $780.57
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NOBID
$38.59 $463.05
NO BiD NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$38.50 $463.05
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$300.97 $3,611.66
Monthly Antual
$65.05 $780.57
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$44.10 $520.20
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$109.15 $1,308.77
Monthly Annual
$178.60 $2,138.20
$121.27 $1.456.30
NO BID NOQ BID
NO BID NO BID
$299.87 $3,598.50
Mouthly Annual
$178.60 $2,143.26
$121.27 $1,455.30
NC BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$178.60 $2,143.26
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$478.47 $5,741.70




sters are located in Township Parks and serviced seven months per ~fApril 1 —

Qctober 31)

We prefer the following to be picked on Fridays ov Mondays

Loeation Type of Container Size  Service Monthly Annual

Shell Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/7mo $44.10 $308.70
4373 Dixie Hwy.

Optimist Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard Wkly/7mo $44.10 $308.70
Entrance where durnpster
is located: 214 Briscoe

Herrington Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkiy/7Tmo $44.10 $308.70
1216 l.ochaven Road

Rotary Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/Tmo $44.10 $308.70
5485 Tubbs Road

Lions Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/Tmo $44.10 $308.70
4250 Fenmore Ave.

PARKS TOTAL (SEVEN MONTH ONLY) $220.50  $1,543.5(

Grand Total All Sites Annually

$21,017.69




Charter Township of Waterford
Trash & Recyelable Material Removal

Supplemental Bid Sheet

UNIT PRICING

In the event additional services are required, all prospective bidders shall be required 1o provide a unit cost schedule
for all mateviat listed below,

2 yard dunypster $38.58/mofweskh
4 yard dumpster $44.10/mojweekh
6 vard dinnpster $65.05/mofweekl:
8 yard dumpster $89.30/mofweack
20 yard open top 5315 + delivery
30 yard open top $415 + delivery
64 gallon reeycle cart {OPTIONAL) NOBID

96 gailon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) NO BID

Residentiai Recycling Program — Specify items to be included

NO BID

Office Paper Recyeling Pick up — Specify items and prepacation of items (commingled, boxes crushed)

STANDARD MIXED USE PAPER + CARDBOARD

Provide the names, address, contact person & telephone numbers of end users

MR. JUSTIN WESTLAKE

FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SUPERINTENDENT
WATERFORD TOWNSHIP DPW

5240 CIVIC CENTER DRIVE

WATERFORD, Ml 48328

(248) 618-7456
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CHARTER TOWNSHIP OF WATERFORD BID DPW-20-01

Trash & Recyclable Material Removal

OAKLAND COUNTY, MICHIGAN

TO: CHARTER TOWNSHIP OF WATERFORD, 5200 CIVIC CENTER DRIVE, WATERFORD, MI 48329

DATE: September 1,2020
BID FORM

This is the Base Bid of Advanced Disposal Services Waste Midwest, LL hereinafter catled the Contractor to the

Charter Township of Waterford.

The Contractor agrees to perform all the work described in the Contvact Documents and Specifications for the
following lwmp swn unit cost for landscape maintenance in accordance with these specifications.

Calendar Year 2021(WITH Recycling Calculated):

NO BID W/RECYCLING Doilars and - cents,
(In Writing) (In Writing)
- Dollars and - cents,
{In Figures) (In Figures)
Calendar Year 2022 (WITH Recyeling Calculated):
NO BID W/RECYCLING Dollats and- cents,
{In Writing) {In Writing)
- Dollars and - cents,
{In Fipures) (In Figures)
Calendar Year 2023 (WITH Recycling Calculated):
NO BID W/RECYCLING Dollats and - Cens.
{1 Writing) {In Writing)
- Dollars and - cenis.
{In Figures) (In Figures)
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Calendar Year 2021 (WITHOUT Recycling Calculated):

Dollars and cents,
(In Writing) (In Writing)

Dotltars and .00 cents.
(In Figures) (In Figures)

$19,084.00

Calendar Year 2022 (WITHOUT Reeycling Caleulated):

Doilars andl cents,
(In Writing) {In Writing)

Dollars and 20 cents,
(In Figures) {In Figures)

$20,017.20

Calendar Year 2023 (WITHOUT Recycling Caleulated):

$21,017.69 Dollars and cents.

(In Writing) (In Writing)

The BASE BID will be filled out completely as vequired. The Base Bid will reflect the cost to complete the entire
project as specified in these documents.

Prices shall be showi in both words and figures, In case of discrepancy, the amount shown in words shall govern.

The successful Contractor shall be required to begin work within the time specified herein. The Contractor
understands that the Owner reserves the right to refect any or all bids and to waive any informalities in the bidding.
The Contractor agrees that their bid shall be good and may not be withdrawa for a petiod of ninety (90) calendar
days after the scheduled closing time for receiving bids.

Upon receipt of written notice of acceptance of this bid, Contractor will execute the formal Contract within the time
specified herein and deliver the surety bond or bonds required,

Signed at 4941 White Lake Road; Clarkston Michigan, 48346 on this day of ,20
Coampany Address
By: Mark Nighbor Vice President
Name Title

Office Telephone Number: (248) 625-6470

Federal License No. 76-0839612 SEAL: 1f by Corporation

¥ NETARVZED
o\
DLEO LT
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Calendar Year 2021 (WITHOUT Recyeling Calculated):

pinveseep ThodsAn? 7 e

Hun bl Forly oree Dollars and Zele  cents.
(In Writing) (In Writing)

d!{_; ! 9{, 24 /" Dollars and € cents.
(In Figures) {(In Figures)

Calendar Year 2022 (WITHOUT Recycling Calculated):

NN E7TZen THows Aunel NMrire

ldhucliterl Seveily pate Dollars and 2.2 cents.
(In Writing) (In Writing)
4% / ‘/: 97/ Dollars and - cents.
(In Figures) (In Figures)
Calendar Year 2023 (WITHOUT Recyeling Calculated):
Fwe T THocusFrol 5%;"
AL&«M C/:'_y% o7 — Dollars and Z . 2€0 cents.
(In Writing) (In Writing)
# Zo,g& Toenms A

noTe: Resideiidl (veeyel wy TROGRAM Afso brduc7ecl A Ve yclivey.

The BASE BID will be filled out completely as required. The Base Bid will reflect the cost to complete the entire
project as specified in these documents,

Prices shall be shown in both words and figures. In case of discrepancy, the amount shown in words shall govern.

The successful Contractor shall be required to begin work within the time specified herein. The Contractor
understands that the Owner reserves the right to reject any or all bids and to waive any informalities in the bidding.
The Contractor agrees that their bid shall be good and may not be withdrawn for a period of ninety (90) calendar
days after the scheduled closing time for receiving bids.

Upon receipt of written notice of acceptance of this bid, Contactor will execute the formal Contract within the time
specified herein and deliver the surety bond or bonds required.

Signed at G & 2o rRAL FRRIE Bivil., Sectszaz _ on this 1_ day of §’/7?M'£e»¢ 1,202,
© Compan Tess S, wtddreld ML .

By: : J C— -y ?«:ﬁw’wAL Viee z‘—;/(s«'M

Name Loy " oedAed rice £77 Title

Office Telephone Number: S44.4(4. 3587
Federal License No. #4@ 61207 SEAL: If by Corporation
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BASE BID — Calendar Year 2021

Residential Recyeling Program

All Locations to be Serviced Once per week

Equipment

Manpower/Labor

RESIDENTIAL SUBTOTAL .

Location Type of Container

FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SITES
51% District Cout Dumpster Trash

Recycle Catt (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)
5100 Civic Center Drive Dumpster Recycle

Facilities & Operations
5170 Civic Center Drive

Dumpster Trash

FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SUBTOTAL

TOWNSHIP LIBRARY SITES

Township Library Dumpster Trash
5168 Civic Center Drive  Dumpster Recycle
Recycle Cart (optional)

Monthly

Annual

TR uc&f Feludes

52 yspe 829400 @

82 4507 <220 *

Size

4 yard
64 gal
96gal
2 yard

6 Yard

6 yard
2 yard
64 gal
96 gal

8 yard
64 gal

96 gal

Recycle Cart (optional)

TOWNSHIP LIBRARY TOTAL
POLICE DEPARTMENT SITES
Police Department & Dumpster Trash
Town Hall Dumpster Recycle 8 yard
5150 Civic Center Drive (Gated) Recycle Cart

(optional}

Recycle Cart

(optional)

POLICE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL

FIRE DEPARTMENT SITES

Fire Station #1
2495 Crescent Lake Rd

Dumpster Trash
Dumpster Recycle
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

Fire Station #2
4596 W Walton Blvd

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

6 yard
2 yard
64 gal
96 gal

4 yard
64 gal
96 gal

25

Service

Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/ 12mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Monthly Annual
55 . bbo. o0
[ c© 26 po
_2p.o0 29002
>Z2.02 35%.c0
$BJ.e0 |,0z0. e
21022 2 570 .00
Monthly Annual
55 00 [, pz0 oo
3Z.0° 387 00
1 & oo 2. 20
20- Z40. oo
155.0 [, §Lo.oe
Monthly Annual
/140 1,3¢8.00
LS00 780.c00
18 00 2. o0
2. o0 240, 00
217.¢ 2,04, 02
Monthly Annual
B5 o0 |, 020,09
3Z.e00  AEY.w0
1 g 20 ZiL. o0
zo.o0 290 0
55.00 bbo. oo
/8. o0 2. oo
zo. g0 ZHo. o©




Fire Station #3
3435 Elizabeth Lake Rd

Fire Station #4
6615 Williams Lake Rd

Fire Station #5
25 N Hospital Road

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart{optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cartt (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

FIRE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Parks Maintenance Garage Dumpster Trash

4458 Hatchery Road

Nature Center
2125 Denby

Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

6 yard
64 gal
96 gal

2 yard
64 gal
96 gal

2 yard
64 gal
96 gal

6 yard
64 gal

96 gal

4 yard
64 gal
96 gal

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Bid Specifications
All Locations to be Serviced Twice per week, except for Reeyeling

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS SITES

DPW Bldg.
5240 Civic Center Dr
(Gated)

DPW SUBTOTAL

Dumpster Trash
Dumpster Recycle

8 yard
4 yard

Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Recreation Center
5640 Williams Lake Rd

Hess-Hathaway Park
825 S Williams Lake Rd

Dumpster Trash

8 yard

2x-Wkly/12mo
2x-Wkly/12mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

2x-Wkly/12mo

Dumpster Recycle(optional)4 yard 2x-Wkly/12mo

Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

64 gal
96 gal

8 yard

64 gal
96 gal

26

Wkiy/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

2x-Wkiy/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

85 .o [ ozo.o0
1§ oo 2. w0
2o-op ZzYl. 00
S0 254 .0
|§. o0 2.1{. 00
20.00 ZHE. oo
325@ . G0
1§.00 2 L. O
Z8.00 Z%0. o2
50/ % _L132.%
Monthly Annual
£S.co I, ©Zo.00
8.0 2lg.0°
20. 00 Z57.00
55.00 L. eo
16 .02 216, @e
2. o6 240, oo
Z1b.oo = S 8E~
Monfhly Annual
225.00 Z, 7w <
}!‘1’.00 ‘ 5‘,&.@0
1§ 00 24f.c0
20. 00 ZYg. oe
3 77.00 Y524 &2
Maonthly Annual
225 .00 2 oo, o
[ 1Y o l, LK. o°
1§ o0 2lé.w0
20, o 2o vo
225.00 2, 7w0.02
/8. 00 21¢. 00
2 oo 240.00
A Ll




The following dumpsters are lacated in Township Parks and serviced seven months per vear {April 1 —

October 31)

We prefer the following to be picked on Fridays or Mondays

Location Type of Container Size  Service Maonthly Annual
Shell Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/7mo 55.00 5 8% o>

4373 Dixie Hwy.

Optimist Park Dumpster Trash -~ 4 yard  Wkly/7mo
Entrance where dumpster “ -
is located: 214 Briscoe

Herrington Park Dumpster T: rash 4 yard  Wkly/7Tmo
1216 Lochaven Road

Rotary Park Dumpster Trash 4yard Wkly/7mo

54835 Tubbs Road

Lions Park Dumpster Trash 4yard  Wkly/7mo \ v

4250 Fenmore

PARKS TOTAL (SEVEN MONTH ONLY) 275 w2 Ltzz.

Grand Total All Sites Annually

$ 59 22799

21 ﬁ/



Charter Township of Waterford
Trash & Recyclable Material Removal

Supplemental Bid Sheet

UNIT PRICING

In the event additional services are required, all prospective bidders shall be required to provide a unit cost schedule
for all material listed below.

2 yard dumpster FZ.00 @Mwﬂf

4 yard dumpster 55, 60 @Mﬁ{

6 yard dumpster BS.co @ M wilt

8 yard dumpster | |14. 00 & /Mmﬁ

20 yard open top 2 95.00 Rpurp Z.Tiows
30 yard open top %95 .0 Curf 3 .5° ror>
64 gallon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) “t oo [Pl CAET

96 gallon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) S.e0  tpr CART

Residential Recycling Program — Specify items to be included

N Sl

Office Paper Recycling Pick up — Specify items and preparation of items (commingled, boxes crushed)

ﬂﬁ@faﬂw M’«;,ﬂt’/—f// ﬁM—cS uaf,wc_«u%igy 5‘0;@9%-/
Caclllonesl e o oo Atotore e & 2O K277

Provide the names, address, contact person & telephone numbers of end users

D e TR

- &



BASE BID — Calendar Year 2022

Residential Recycling Program Monthly Annual
Equipment Zveheddl Tl
Manpower/Labor 2, 559270¢ Ao e ©°
RESIDENTIAL SUBTOTAL Z. S50 3000 %
All Locations to be Serviced Once per week
Location Type of Container Size  Service
FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SITES Monthly Annual
51% District Court Dumpster Trash d4yard Wkly/12 mo 5700 &% =0
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal ~ Wkly/12 mo 1 9 .e0 228 o0
Recycle Cart (optional) ~ 96gal ~ Wkly/12 mo 2/ .o 2.52.00
5100 Civic Center Drive Dumpster Recycle 2yard EOW/12 mo A23. 00 2D%.z0
Facilities & Operations  Dumpster Trash 6 Yard Wkly/12 mo 58 e L05.2°
5170 Civic Center Drive
FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SUBTOTAL 218.00 ZLlb.o0
TOWNSHIP LIBRARY SITES Monthly Annual
Township Library Dumpster Trash 6 yard Wkly/12 mo L8 oo L oSk a0
5168 Civic Center Drive Dumpster Recycle 2yard EOW/12 mo 33 .o0 29.c0
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal Wkly/12 mo /9. o0 228 o0
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo Z/.e0 252.e
TOWNSHIP LIBRARY TOTAL l.oe /,932.00°
POLICE DEPARTMENT SITES Monthly Annual
Police Department & Dumpster Trash 8 yard Wkly/12 mo /1% ec [', 425 oo
Town Hall Dumpster Recycle 8 yard EOW/12 mo (¥ .00 K. co
5150 Civic Center Drive (Gated) Recycle Cart 64 gal Wkly/12 mo /9. 00 2.25.0D
(optional) 2 00
Recycle Cart 96 gal Wkly/12 mo 2/.0° 252
(optional) &
POLICE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL VA 2@
FIRE DEPARTMENT SITES Monthly Annual
Fire Station #1 Dumpster Trash 6 yard Wkly/12 mo 88. o0 [,05¢. o2
2495 Crescent Lake Rd  Dumpster Recycle 2yard EOW/ 12mo 5% .o 39¢.00
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo 19. 00 Z27Zs.00
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo Z].oc 292
Fire Station #2 Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/12 mo 5 J.e0 (8% e
4596 W Walton Blvd Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal EOW/12 mo 19.00 22§ a0
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal EOW/12 mo 2102 252, @

29
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Fire Station #3
3435 Elizabeth Lake Rd

Fire Station #4
6615 Williams Lake Rd

Fire Station #5
25 N Hospital Road

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart {optional)
Recycle Cart(optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash
Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

FIRE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Parks Maintenance Garage Dumpster Trash

4458 Hatchery Road

Nature Center
2125 Denby

Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash

Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Catt (optional)

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

6 yard
64 gal
96 gal

2 yard
64 gal
96 pal

2 yard
64 gal
96 gal

6 yard
64 gal
96 gal

4 yard
64 gal
96 gal

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Bid Specifications

All Locations to be Serviced Twice per week, except for Recyeling

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS SITES

DPW Bldg,
5240 Civic Center Dr
(Gated)

DPW SUBTOTAL

Dumpster Trash
Dumpster Recycle

Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal

8 yard
4 yard

Recyele Cart (optional) 96 gal

PARKS & RECREATION SITLS

Recreation Center
5640 Williams Lake Rd

Hess-Hathaway Park
825 S Williams Lake Rd

Dumpster Trash

Dumpster Recycle(optional)d yard

Recycle Cart (optional)

Recycle Cart (optional)

Dumpster Trash

Recycle Cart (optional)
Recycle Cart (optional)

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

8 yard

64 gal
96 gal

8 yard

64 gal
96 gal

30

2x-Wkly/12mo
2x-Wkly/12mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

2x-Wkly/12mo
2x-Wkly/12mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

2x-Wkly/12 mo
Wkiy/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

8560 [,05b,00
|9 22 2. 28.00
Z/. 00 252 o0
33. 00 2900
[%-20 2.2%.00
Z! .00 252 w0
23 .00 LA
17.00 225 @
21 .00 252
532 (287
Monthly Annual
88 = [,£56.00
1q.00 226 oo
2l . ev 252 00
_57.©¢ (5% #°
1G.00 2728 00
2L e° 252
225'w 2{ 7”' o
Monthly Annual
23,00 2, 86
[ 19. 00 | 25 o
| 9- @0 T 22K @f
2..00 252
2G93, ¢ 4}7/& wo
Monthly Annual
234.0° Z, 5tg o2
(9.00 225e°
7 X i 2520
239 A sl
19.e0¢ 275 @o
Zt.oe 267 we
b/ § w0t er




The folowing dumpsters are located in Township Parks and serviced seven months per vear (April 1

October 31)

We prefer the following to be picked on Fridays or Moundays

Location Type of Container Size Service Monthly Annual
Shell Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkiy/7mo 57 oo 39 7.00

4373 Dixie Hwy.

Optimist Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/7mo
Entrance where dumpster
is located: 214 Briscoe

Herrington Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard Wkly/7mo
1216 Lochaven Road
Rotary Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard Wkly/7mo

5485 Tubbs Road

Lions Park Dumpster Trash dyard Wkly/7mo J
4250 Fenmore Ave.

PARKS TOTAL (SEVEN MONTH ONLY) 28660 | G95.08

Grand Total All Sites Annually

$_Gl L7 o

s @/



Charter Township of Waterford
Trash & Recyclable Material Removal

Supplemental Bid Sheet
UNIT PRICING

In the event additional services are required, all prospective bidders shall be required to provide a unit cost schedule
for all material listed below.

2 yard dumpster 33.00 QJM&/

4 yard dumpster 5700 @ W

6 yard dumpster gg o0 67 M

8 yard dumpster /19.00 &

20 yard open top 207 00 & Dy Z.57645
30 yard open top j |Z.oe @'Duﬂﬂ,-?.fﬂ?s-"s‘
64 gallon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) 5.e0 7‘24«&“}

96 gallon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) Lo Pee c’;a«v{/

Residential Recycling Program — Specify items to be included

lnae AT T 1=

Office Paper Recycling Pick up — Specify items and preparation of items (commingled, boxes crushed)

/’%3 “/afza @LMmmﬂﬁwyo’aVWJ

Zoe i hoarall e & fo Bolin Lpens © ZFXZH

Provide the names, address, contact person & telephone numbers of end users

; &



BASE BID — Calendar Year 2023

Residential Recyeling Program Monthly Annual
Equipment ’}}u&[uM Teleckel?
Manpower/Labor Zbsa s S| fapw. e~
RESIDENTIAL SUBTOTAL 2500 FL5000%
All Locations to be Serviced Once per week
Location Type of Container Size Service
FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SITES Monthly Annual
51% District Court Dumpster Trash 4 yard Wkly/12 mo 59.00 708, o0
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal ~ Wkly/12 mo 208, @0 24o. 00
Recycle Cart (optional) ~ 96gal ~ Wkly/12 mo 2Z. o0 20 o0
5100 Civic Center Drive Dumpster Recycle 2yard EOW/12 mo 35 .00 H2o.00
Facilities & Operations ~ Dumpster Trash 6 Yard Wkly/12 mo 72.00 7 (,/ oY **
5170 Civic Center Drive
FACILITIES & OPERATIONS SUBTOTAL 228 a0 273,
TOWNSHIP LIBRARY SITES Monthly Annual
Township Library Dumpster Trash 6yard Wkly/12 mo y |, /64 o0
5168 Civic Center Drive Dumpster Recycle 2yard EOW/12 mo 55.00 < 20.50
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo Zo. o0 Zye. o0
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo 2Z e 2. 2
TOWNSHIP LIBRARY TOTAL /7% 2. 028:%
POLICE DEPARTMENT SITES Monthly Annual
Police Department & Dumpster Trash 8 yard Wkly/12 mo | 24.00 | HEE w0
Town Hall Dumpster Recycle 8 yard EOW/12 mo 72.00 5G¥. o2
5150 Civic Center Drive (Gated) Recycle Cart 64 gal Wkly/12 mo Ze.oo 24e. we
(optional) .
Recycle Cart 96 gal Wkly/12 mo 2204 2.0
(optional)
POLICE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL 228°%° 285¢ -2
FIRE DEPARTMENT SITES Monthly Annual
Fire Station #1 Dumpster Trash 6yard Wkly/12 mo 7Z.oo /, (10Y. el
2495 Crescent Lake Rd  Dumpster Recycle 2 yard EOW/ 12mo 35.6° 4{F0. a0
Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal  Wkly/12 mo Zo.oo 24220
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal  Wkly/12 mo 2200 Lioo
Fire Station #2 Dumpster Trash 4 yard Wkly/12 mo 590 Jo5 o
4596 W Walton Blvd Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal EOW/I2 mo 20.00 ZHp. ¢ °
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal EOW/12 mo 22.00 Z(Yf o
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Fire Station #3 Dumpster Trash 6 yard
3435 Elizabeth Lake Rd  Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart(optional) 96 gal
Fire Station #4 Dumpster Trash 2 yard
6615 Williams Lake Rd  Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gat
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal
Fire Station #5 Dumpster Trash 2 yard
25 N Hospital Road Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal
FIRE DEPARTMENT SUBTOTAL
PARKS & RECREATION SITES
Parks Maintenance Garage Dumpster Trash 6 yard
4458 Hatchery Road Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal
Nature Center Dumpster Trash 4 yard
2125 Denby Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recyele Cart (optional) 96 gal

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkiy/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
EOW/12 mo
EOW/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Whkiy/12 mo

Bid Specifications
All Locations to be Serviced Twice per week, except for Recyeling

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS SITLS

DPW Bldg. Dumpster Trash 8 yard
5240 Civic Center Dr Dumpster Recycle 4 yard
(Gated) Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal

Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal
DPW SUBTOTAL

PARKS & RECREATION SITES

Dumpster Trash 8 yard
Dumpster Recycle(optional)4 yard

Recreation Center
5640 Williams Lake Rd

Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal
Hess-Hathaway Park Dumpster Trash 8 yard
825 S Williams Lake Rd  Recycle Cart (optional) 64 gal
Recycle Cart (optional) 96 gal

PARKS & RECREATION SUBTOTAL

34

2x-Wkly/12mo
2x-Wkly/12mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

2x-Wkly/i2mo
2x-Wkly/I2mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo

2x-Wkly/12 mo
Wkly/12 mo
Wkiy/12 mo

92 e [, le¥ .00
Zo.oo ' 240.00
ZZ.e0 241>
3500 < 2.0
Zo. 0 24p0.00
Z2Z.08 2LY. 00
35 .00 “|Zo. o0
Z®., o0 292 00
Z2. o0 24400
55580 L. o0
Monthly Annual
gz 89 [, 10Y-0°
Zo.©0 " 2Ho.p0
22 oo Z b4 o
5.0 708 o
2. Q0 242, oo
ZZ. oo ZLH. o
23500 2 &2%
Monthiy Annual
245 @0 2740, a0
| 24, oo [ 456 w0
2. o0 2Yo. @c
22 e° Z LY. 0o
1.0 4932 %
Monthly Annual
245.00 .00
[ 24 o0 LY B& w0
Ze.o? 2Y0, a°
22 o° 209 .9°
ZH5.00 2940
22, a2 240 9
24. oo 2o
0¥ S3UY

L{



The following dumpsters are located in Township Parks and serviced seven months per year (Apvil 1 —

October 31)

We prefer the following to be picked on Fridays or Mondays

Location Type of Container Size Service Monthly Annual
Shell Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/7mo 54.co <f|3.00

4373 Dixie Hwy.

Optimist Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/7mo
Entrance where dumpster
is located: 214 Briscoe

Herrington Park Dumpster ‘Trash 4 yard  Wkly/7mo
1216 Lochaven Road

Rotary Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/7mo

5485 Tubbs Road

Lions Park Dumpster Trash 4 yard  Wkly/7mo \J \

4250 Fenmore Ave.

PARKS TOTAL (SEVEN MONTH ONLY) 2?5“"; Z oLS. %

Grand Total All Sites Annually

$ LY 3BZ
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Charter Township of Waterford
Trash & Recyclable Material Removal

Supplemental Bid Sheet
UNIT PRICING

In the event additional services are required, all prospective bidders shall be required to provide a unit cost schedule
for all material listed below.

2 yard dumpster 25.00 @/}gm,fz/

4 yard dumpster 59.00 _@ 4/&»1{
6 yard dumpster 4 Z oo @ /M
@ el

8 yard dumpster | 24 . o0

20 yard open top 220.00 (@ Dunf-Z- 51085
30 yard open top 429.00 (& Durf/- 3. 50 7oV
64 gallon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) boo P lot

96 gallon recycle cart (OPTIONAL) 7. eo o

Residential Recycling Program — Specify items to be included

Office Paper Recycling Pick up — Specify items and preparation of items (commingled, boxes crushed)

Rl e B s st X T T

Provide the names, address, contact person & telephone numbers of end users

%MMZ#/ o
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CHARTER TOWNSHIP OF WATERFORD BID DPW-20-01

Trash & Recyclable Material Removal
OAKLAND COUNTY, MICHIGAN
TO: CHARTER TOWNSHIP OF WATERFORD, 5200 CIVIC CENTER DRIVE, WATERFORD, MI 48329
DATE: Sepzeubes | ,202©
BID FORM

This is the Base Bid of £FL fur/iRer el st ruse , hereinafter called the Contractor fo the
Charter Township of Waterford,

The Contractor agrees to perform all the work described in the Contract Documents and Specifications for the
following lump sum unit cost for Trash and recycling removal in accordance with these specifications.

Calendar Year 2021(WITH Recycling Caleulated):

?}/fy A}:'N&Tﬁwu < Apa 2 _/'—;)0

Hu ;vc,/&/ %‘d?"/ S, L sy Dollars and Zr:-@ cents.
(In Writing) (In Writing)

#5 7', 2 577 Dollars and £ cents.
(In Figures) (In Figures)

Calendar Year 2022 (WITH Recycling Calculated):

KTy oOneTrod spned Sey
(o cde s Sevemly One Dollars and ZeAD cents.
© (In Writing) : (In Writing)
i &l -7/ Dollars and £ cents.
(In Figures) (In Figures)

Calendar Year 2023 (WITH Recycling Calculated):

S ety FourRk Thousind ke
/J% ,ua/ﬂaﬁ 77 g ~2¢¢  Dollars and _Zede cents.
(In Writing} (In Writing)
ﬁ é 5323 Dollars and <5 cents.
(In Figures) (In Figures)
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